

Discount Rate, Landed, Netm, Accessories, Retail Prices, Shipping Terms, Collection #

Unit Pricing/Details, Service, Warranty

Table with columns: Selection / Product Category, Product Number, Discount, Net Single Unit Price, Discount, Net Qty Price, Service, Service Type, Service Hourly Rate, Fixed Price, Warranty OEM (Years/Mo.), Extended Warranty, URL. Contains sections 2.0, 2.1, 2.2, 2.3, 2.4, 2.5, 2.6, 2.7.

Section 2.5 - Analog & Digital Motorcycle Rear-mounted Radios: 160 channel, two-piece, VHF High-band (150-170 MHz), 450-470 MHz UHF, and 800-869 MHz, all solid-state motorcycle radio for use in Arizona & Public Communications Systems.

Section 2.6 - Low Power Vehicle Repeater: VHF, UHF, and 700/800 MHz in vehicle mounted repeater, for attachment to the vehicle's mobile radio and extends the range of the user's portable radio.

Section 2.7 - Multi-Band Radios: Mobile and portable capable of operation on more than one public safety band.

Unit Pricing/Details

Selection / Product Category	Product Number	Discount		Discount		Service			Warranty		URL Link for catalogs exceeding 10MB	
		Offered (1-59)	Net Single Unit Price	Offered (60+)	Net Qty Price	Included Yes or No	Service Type Design, Engineering, PSE, etc.)	Service Hourly Rate	Fees Price	Warranty OEM (Years/Mos.)		Extended Warranty
2.0 2-way Radio	Nylon carrying case with a loop F112/1 radios	NCF211LODP	\$25.00	30%	\$17.25	N/A	No	N/A	N/A	N/A	1 year from date of purchase	Not offered at this time
	Nylon carrying case with a clip for the F3001/4001, F3101/4101 radios	NCF3001CLIP	\$27.00	30%	\$18.90	N/A	No	N/A	N/A	N/A	1 year from date of purchase	Not offered at this time
	Nylon carrying case with a clip and cutout for the display	NCF3013CLIP	\$27.00	30%	\$18.90	N/A	No	N/A	N/A	N/A	1 year from date of purchase	Not offered at this time
	Nylon carrying case with a clip and cutout for the display	NCF3013LODP	\$25.00	30%	\$17.50	N/A	No	N/A	N/A	N/A	1 year from date of purchase	Not offered at this time
	Nylon case with a loop for the F3161/4161 radios without a OTM-Cutout	NCF3015LODP	\$25.00	30%	\$17.50	N/A	No	N/A	N/A	N/A	1 year from date of purchase	Not offered at this time
	Nylon carrying case with a loop for the F3161/4161 radios with a full keypad	NCF3016LODP	\$25.00	30%	\$17.50	N/A	No	N/A	N/A	N/A	1 year from date of purchase	Not offered at this time
	Nylon carrying case with a loop for the F2006/3006, M401 radios	NCF2006LODP	\$25.00	30%	\$17.50	N/A	No	N/A	N/A	N/A	1 year from date of purchase	Not offered at this time
	Nylon carrying case with a clip and cutout for the OTM keypad for F3261 series	NCF3261CLIP	\$27.00	30%	\$18.90	N/A	No	N/A	N/A	N/A	1 year from date of purchase	Not offered at this time
	Nylon carrying case with a clip for the F3011/3021 radios without a full keypad	NCF3011CLIP	\$30.00	30%	\$21.00	N/A	No	N/A	N/A	N/A	1 year from date of purchase	Not offered at this time
	Nylon carrying case with a clip for the F3011/3021 radios with a full keypad	NCF3011LODP	\$30.00	30%	\$21.00	N/A	No	N/A </tr				

Selection / Product Category	Product Number	Unit Pricing/Details		Discount		Service		Service		Warranty		URL Link for catalogs exceeding 10MB	
		List Price	Net Single Price	Offered (1-5%)	Offered (6-9%)	Yes or No	Service Type (Design, Engineering, PSE, etc.)	Service Hourly Rate	Fried Price	Warranty OEM (Years/Mos.)	Extended Warranty		
2.0 2-way Radio	VDR/PTT switch cable to use with headset (H94/PS/97)	ESDMC	\$130.00	3m	\$126.00	N/A	No	N/A	N/A	N/A	1 year from date of purchase	Not offered at this time	http://www.icomamerica.com/clientproposal
Supporting Services for Icom America 2-way Radios													
Dealer installation (remote satellite or v-hub)	DEALER FIELD INSTALL		\$358.57	0%	\$358.57	N/A	No	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	
Authorized Dealer Support	DEALER HOURLY RATE		\$180.00	0%	\$180.00	N/A	No	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	
ENGRAVE Engineering For radios	ENGRAVE		\$30.00	0%	\$30.00	N/A	No	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	
EXTWAR21 1-yr Warranty Includes: RPT #2 Repeater Only	EXTWAR21		\$997.50	0%	\$997.50	N/A	No	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	
EXTWAR22 2-yr Warranty Includes: RPT #2 Repeater Only	EXTWAR22		\$1,500.00	0%	\$1,500.00	N/A	No	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	
1 year extended warranty for a total 3 years	EXTWAR211		\$25.00	0%	\$25.00	N/A	No	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	
2 year extended warranty for a total 4 years	EXTWAR212		\$44.00	0%	\$44.00	N/A	No	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	
3 year extended warranty for a total 5 years	EXTWAR213		\$62.00	0%	\$62.00	N/A	No	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	
1 year extended warranty	EXTWAR211		\$40.00	0%	\$40.00	N/A	No	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	
2 year extended warranty	EXTWAR212		\$70.00	0%	\$70.00	N/A	No	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	
3 year extended warranty	EXTWAR213		\$110.00	0%	\$110.00	N/A	No	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	
1 year extended warranty	EXTWAR211		\$65.00	0%	\$65.00	N/A	No	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	
2 year extended warranty	EXTWAR212		\$93.00	0%	\$93.00	N/A	No	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	
3 year extended warranty	EXTWAR213		\$130.00	0%	\$130.00	N/A	No	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	
1 year extended warranty	EXTWAR211		\$125.00	0%	\$125.00	N/A	No	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	
2 year extended warranty	EXTWAR212		\$245.00	0%	\$245.00	N/A	No	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	
3 year extended warranty	EXTWAR214		\$245.00	0%	\$245.00	N/A	No	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	
1 year extended warranty for a total 3 years	EXTWAR211		\$180.00	0%	\$180.00	N/A	No	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	
2 year extended warranty for a total 4 years	EXTWAR212		\$325.00	0%	\$325.00	N/A	No	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	
3 year extended warranty for a total 5 years	EXTWAR213		\$465.00	0%	\$465.00	N/A	No	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	
Tuning fee for duplexers	INSTUN1001		\$56.25	0%	\$56.25	N/A	No	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	
Installation For Avionics	INSTALLATION AVIONICS		\$30.00	0%	\$30.00	N/A	No	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	
Installation For Marine	INSTALLATION MARINE		\$30.00	0%	\$30.00	N/A	No	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	
Install a component into a transceiver or cabinet	INSTALLIAS		\$56.25	0%	\$56.25	N/A	No	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	
Install a component into an mobile or portable	INSTALLMP		\$30.00	0%	\$30.00	N/A	No	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	
Icom to program your system products	PROG-IAS		\$56.25	0%	\$56.25	N/A	No	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	
Icom to program your mobile or portable	PROG-MP		\$30.00	0%	\$30.00	N/A	No	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	
Programming For Avionics	PROGRAMMING AVIONICS		\$30.00	0%	\$30.00	N/A	No	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	
Programming For Marine	PROGRAMMING MARINE		\$30.00	0%	\$30.00	N/A	No	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	
Hourly rate for custom systems builds	SERVICES/SALE BUILD-UP IAS		\$120.00	0%	\$120.00	N/A	No	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	
Comprehensive Repair CASE 3yrs	CRS3YR		\$212.50	0%	\$212.50	N/A	No	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	
Comprehensive Repair P25 3yrs	CRS3YR25		\$243.75	0%	\$243.75	N/A	No	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	
Engineering support per hour	ENGR-PH		\$200.00	0%	\$200.00	N/A	No	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	
On-Site Technical/Field Support 1st Day	OFS-1D		\$5,200.00	0%	\$5,200.00	N/A	No	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	
On-Site Technical/Field Support Additional Days	OFS-AD		\$3,200.00	0%	\$3,200.00	N/A	No	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	
Field/Dispatch support per hour	OFS-PH		\$175.00	0%	\$175.00	N/A	No	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	
Network Phone Support per hour	ONS-N		\$205.00	0%	\$205.00	N/A	No	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	
24/7/365 Phone Support	OTT-24PS-D		\$600.00	0%	\$600.00	N/A	No	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	
24/7/365 Phone Support	OTT-24PS-I		\$400.00	0%	\$400.00	N/A	No	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	
On-Site Technical Training 1st Day, Up to 6 People	OTT-OS1D		\$5,200.00	0%	\$5,200.00	N/A	No	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	
On-Site Technical Training Additional Days, Up to 6 People	OTT-OSAD		\$3,200.00	0%	\$3,200.00	N/A	No	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	
Technical training from their stock	OTT-OSPH		\$175.00	0%	\$175.00	N/A	No	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	
3.0 Digital Microwave Terminals	Icom America Inc. - NO BID												
4.0 LMR Base Station Antennas	Icom America Inc. - NO BID												
4.0 Microwave Antennas	Icom America Inc. - NO BID												
5.0 Radio Dispatch Consoles	Icom America Inc. - NO BID												
6.0 Generators	Icom America Inc. - NO BID												
7.0 Back-up Batteries	Icom America Inc. - NO BID												
8.0 Prefab Comm Shelters	Icom America Inc. - NO BID												
9.0 Service	Icom America Inc. - NO BID												
10.0 Consultation and Third-Party Oversight	Icom America Inc. - NO BID												